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Abstract: The aim of the research is to study the psychological characteristics of 
women with breast cancer during remission. The sample of subjects consisted of two 
clinical groups: women with breast cancer diagnosed before the study and who were in 
remission for 6 months or more at the time of the study. In the course of the study, it 
was found that women with breast cancer, depending on the stage of the disease (onset 
of the disease or remission), have different severity of psychological characteristics 
(basic beliefs, coping behavior methods, locus of control, resilience, life orientation) 
relative to each other and relative to the norms of questionnaires. The conducted 
research enables us to outline the prospects for further research. 
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1 Introduction 

There is an increase in oncological diseases all over the world. 
Cancer is considered the main cause of death and an important 
obstacle to increasing life expectancy in all countries of the 
world. According to the analytical forecasts of the International 
Agency for Research on Cancer (IARC), by 2040 the rate of new 
cases of malignant neoplasms will exceed 28.4 million, 
assuming that the figures estimated in 2020 will remain 
unchanged (Ferlay et al., 2020). According to experts of the 
International Agency for Research on Cancer, 19.3 million new 
cases of cancer and approximately 10 million deaths from cancer 
were registered worldwide in 2020 (Ferlay et al., 2020). Due to 
the morbidity in 2020, breast cancer (11.7%) surpassed lung 
cancer (11.4%) as the most commonly diagnosed cancer in the 
world, followed by rectal cancer (10%), prostate cancer (7.3%) 
and stomach cancer (5.6%). Lung cancer is the leading cause of 
cancer death in 2020 (18% of deaths), followed by cancer of the 
rectum (9.4%), liver (8.3%), stomach (7.7%) and breast (6.9%) 
(Ferlay et al., 2020). 

Among the female population of the world, breast cancer is the 
most commonly diagnosed cancer and the main cause of death 
from cancer. Among women, breast cancer accounts for 1 in 4 
cancer cases and 1 in 6 cancer deaths, ranking first in morbidity 
in the vast majority of countries (159 out of 185 countries) and 
in mortality in 110 countries (Sung et al., 2021).  

The World Health Organization claims aging and population 
growth, as well as features of socio-economic development, the 
leading reasons for the increase in the number of diseases with 
malignant neoplasms (Ferlay et al., 2020). It is noted that with 
the growth of socio-economic well-being of the country, the risk 
of infectious cancer is reduced, but at the same time there is an 
increase in the number of tumors based on hormonal disorders 
and poor nutrition. 

In Russia, according to the International Agency for Research on 
Cancer, the leading place in morbidity in 2020 is occupied by 
malignant neoplasms of the large intestine (13.1%), followed by 
breast cancer (12.7%), lung cancer (10.8%), prostate cancer 
(7.9%) and stomach cancer (6.3%). Among men, lung cancer is 
the most common in terms of morbidity in 2020 (18%), among 

women – breast cancer (24.4%). In terms of mortality rates in 
2020, lung cancer (17.4%), stomach cancer (8.9%), intestinal 
cancer (8.1%), breast cancer (7.4%), pancreatic cancer (6.6%) 
ranks first in Russia (Ferlay et al., 2020). 

According to the presented statistics, breast cancer is the most 
common among the female population in the world and Russia. 
As risk factors for the development of breast cancer, Russian 
researchers identify genetic burden, hormonal and 
immunological status of women, age of women, deterioration in 
the level and quality of life of the population, improvement in 
the quality of diagnosis and accounting of malignant neoplasms, 
reproductive factors (regularity of the menstrual cycle, the 
number of births, breastfeeding, the presence of abortions and 
miscarriages), exposure to ionizing radiation, alcohol 
consumption on a daily basis in combination with other negative 
risk factors and others (Tarabrina, 2014; Sukhareva et al., 2017; 
Letyagin et al., 2006; Chissov et al., 2012; Merabishvili, 2007; 
Egorova & Shaplygin, 2013).  

2 Literature Review 

Analyzing foreign studies, we can find several groups of factors 
associated with the risk of breast cancer. Considering the 
reproductive factors of breast cancer development, Zhou (2015) 
and colleagues note that women who have not given birth have 
about twice the risk compared to women who have given birth to 
three or more children. The authors also emphasize the 
relationship between the later age of the first birth (after 35 
years) and the occurrence of breast cancer in comparison with 
women who gave birth before the age of 20 (Zhou et al., 2015). 
Breastfeeding, especially long-term, can lead to a reduction in 
the risk of breast cancer: the incidence of cancer decreases by 
4.3% for every 12 months of breastfeeding (Collaborative Group 
on Hormonal Factors in Breast Cancer, 2002). A number of 
researchers note that menstrual characteristics (early age of 
menarche, late age of menopause and type of menopause) can 
act as markers of the risk of developing breast malignancies 
(Collaborative Group on Hormonal Factors in Breast Cancer, 
2012). Evidence linking the use of oral contraceptives by a 
woman with the occurrence of breast cancer was described in a 
worldwide epidemiological study of the joint Group on 
Hormonal Risk Factors for Breast Cancer (Collaborative Group 
on Hormonal Factors in Breast Cancer, 1996). Colditz (1998) 
found a link between a woman's high height in adolescence and 
the development of breast cancer in adulthood. The authors 
explain this relationship, among other things, by the fact that 
human height is associated with the age of menarche, and 
menarche is inversely related to the risk of breast cancer 
(Collaborative Group on Hormonal Factors in Breast Cancer, 
2012).  

The relationship between body mass index, obesity and breast 
cancer risk has been studied in a number of researches (Renehan 
et al., 2008; Suzuki et al., 2009; Vrieling et al., 2010). Research 
data suggest that increased physical activity reduces the risk of 
breast cancer: a 25% reduction in average risk was found for the 
most physically active women compared to the least active 
women (Zhou et al., 2015). A statistically significant increase in 
the risk of breast cancer (from 8% to 17%) is associated with a 
sedentary lifestyle (Shen et al., 2014; Zhou et al., 2015). 

Revealing the genetic risk factors for breast cancer, the authors 
note that women in whose family there were cases of breast 
cancer in their closest relatives have a 1.5-2 times greater risk of 
developing breast cancer (Familial Breast Cancer Working 
Group, 2001). An increased risk of breast cancer was observed 
in those who were exposed to radiation at any age. 

Considering endogenous factors of breast cancer, many 
researchers emphasize that endogenous estrogens increase the 
risk of breast cancer: there is a direct relationship between the 
level of estrogen in the blood and the risk of developing 
malignant neoplasms (Key et al., 2002, 2013; Yager & 
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Davidson, 2006; Zhang et al., 2013; Colditz, 1998; Thomas et 
al., 1997; Zanetta et al., 2000). Progesterone plays a key role in 
breast development, and according to experimental data, 
progesterone metabolites can both reduce and increase the risk of 
breast cancer (Wiebe, 2006; Wiebe et al., 2010).  

Additional markers of breast cancer risk include the use of hair 
dye (Takkouche et al., 2005), bras (Chen et al., 2014), 
deodorants (Mirick et al., 2002) and breast implants (Lipworth et 
al., 2009). A potential risk factor for the occurrence of malignant 
neoplasms of the mammary glands is occupational: exposure to 
chemical compounds (Mikoczy et al., 2011), electromagnetic 
fields (Chen et al., 2010), night shift employment with 
subsequent suppression of melatonin production (He et al., 
2015). These risk markers are considered by the authors as 
assumptions and require additional research. 

Despite the growing interest in the problem of breast cancer in 
women, the range of psychological phenomena studied in this 
area is quite limited. It is worth noting that the works of 
P. Revidi (1983), H.J. Eysenck (1994), L. Temoshok (1987), 
Y. Chida (Chida et al., 2008), I.G. Malkina-Pyh (2008), 
M.G. Ivashkina (2016), N.V. Tarabrina (2014) and others 
describe the psychological prerequisites for the development of 
malignant neoplasms. As risk factors for the occurrence of breast 
cancer, the authors identify restraint in the manifestation of 
emotions (Revidi, 1983; Temoshok, 1987; Fasano et al., 2020), 
pronounced feelings of guilt and self-doubt (Revidi, 1983), 
external locus of control and low importance of the value of 
health (Ivashkina, 2016), unproductive coping strategies (Chida 
et al., 2008; Fasano et al., 2020), feelings of hopelessness and 
self-helplessness (Temoshok, 1987), rigidity of attitudes (Revidi, 
1983), feelings of despair and depression (Revidi, 1983) and 
others. 

The indicated risk factors for breast cancer (reproductive, 
genetic, psychological, hormonal, lifestyle-related, etc.) are 
justified by researchers using theoretical conclusions, and/or 
statistical, and/or empirical, and/or experimental data and allow, 
based on the available information, to identify the relevance of 
the problem of breast cancer development today.  

Breast cancer, in addition to the threat to physical health and life, 
differs in the strength and intensity of the traumatic effect, which 
consists in the fear of losing femininity, which is associated with 
causing a cosmetic defect. Also, this disease can be perceived as 
a factor that disrupt a person's socio-psychological adaptation 
and affects the relationships with others. J. Fasano et al. (2020) 
emphasize the role of psychological characteristics in coping 
with stress caused by a long treatment process. H.J. Eysenck 
(1994) notes that a person with such personal characteristics as 
self-sacrifice, conformity, suppression of anger, manifestation of 
anxiety and anxiety, and others, in case of cancer, faces a faster 
death than people with other personal characteristics. 

Speaking about the study of the psychological characteristics of 
patients with oncopathology with different course of the disease, 
we can note the study of M.P. Ershova (Aralova & Ershova, 
2005). The author investigated the features of personal 
development of boys and girls with cancer pathology with 
different remission periods and notes that the remission period 
significantly determines the personal characteristics of boys and 
girls with cancer diagnosis. At the same time, the most 
psychologically stressful period is from 5 to 10 years after direct 
treatment. V.A. Chulkova and E.V. Pestereva (2015) studied the 
peculiarities of psychological adaptation to the disease of 
patients with malignant lymphomas at various stages of the 
disease (before treatment, during primary treatment, during the 
treatment of relapses, remission).  

3 Research Methodological Framework 

Based on the urgency of the problem of the prevalence and 
development of breast cancer, the existing prerequisites for the 
study of the psychological characteristics of patients with breast 
cancer with different course of the disease, the purpose of this 
work was formulated: to study the psychological characteristics 

of women with breast cancer during remission. The realization 
of this goal will make it possible to subsequently identify 
psychological factors that contribute to improving the long-term 
effectiveness of treatment. Psychological characteristics of 
women in remission can act as a criterion for predicting the 
course of the disease. 

In accordance with the purpose of the study, empirical tasks 
were identified. Firstly, to diagnose psychological characteristics 
(basic beliefs, coping behavior, locus of control, resilience, life 
orientation) in women with breast cancer in remission and 
women with diagnosed breast cancer at the time of the study. 
Secondly, to compare psychological characteristics (basic 
beliefs, coping behavior, locus of control, resilience, life 
orientation) in women with breast cancer during remission and at 
the stage of diagnosis with the normative indicators of the 
studied characteristics. 

The general scheme of empirical research was determined by the 
purpose of the work. In accordance with the purpose of the 
study, the sample consisted of two clinical groups. Firstly, 
women with breast cancer diagnosed before the study and in 
remission for 6 months or more at the time of the study. The 
criterion for inclusion of patients in the research sample was the 
onset of remission during the disease and the duration of this 
remission – 6 months or more. Complete remission (CR; 
complete remission) – the complete disappearance of all tumor 
manifestations of the disease, confirmed by the same research 
methods that revealed these changes, and, if necessary, 
additional research methods. Complete remission is established 
after the end of treatment and only if it persists for at least four 
months after the end of the program. Secondly, women with 
diagnosed breast cancer at the time of the study who are under 
the supervision of an oncologist from the moment of diagnosis. 
The criteria for inclusion of patients in the study were: the 
presence of a malignant tumor originating from the epithelium of 
breast tissue (breast cancer) of stage I, II, III and IV with a 
moderately differentiated variant of the tumor, hormone-
dependent therapy, being under the supervision of an oncologist 
from the moment of diagnosis up to 6 months. 

The basis of the empirical research was the Chelyabinsk 
Regional Clinical Center of Oncology and Nuclear Medicine, 
Chelyabinsk. A total of 289 women participated in the study, 98 
of them in remission aged 39 to 79 years, average age 57 years, 
median 58 years; at the stage of diagnosis, 191 people aged 26 to 
80 years, average age 55.5 years, median 57 years. 

The research methods were questionnaire survey, testing 
method, methods of mathematical data processing. The testing 
and questionnaire survey were conducted in an individual form. 
The questionnaire allowed us to collect data on socio-
demographic indicators. The following research methods were 
used: World assumption scale (R. Janoff-Bulman, adaptation by 
M.A. Padun, A.V. Kotelnikova (2008)), the Life Orientation 
Test (Scheier M.F., Carver C.S., adaptation by D.A. Tsiring, 
K.Yu. Evnina (2013)), “Ways of Coping Questionnaire” 
(R. Lazarus, S. Folkman, adaptation by T.L. Kryukova, 
E. V. Kuftyak, M.S. Zamyshlyaeva) (Kryukova, 2010), 
Hardiness Survey (S. Maddi, adaptation by D. Leontiev) 
(Leontiev & Rasskazova, 2006), Subjective control test 
questionnaire (J., Rotter, adaptation by E.F. Bazhin, 
S.A. Golynkina, A.M. Etkind (1984)). Mathematical methods of 
statistical data processing are presented by methods of 
descriptive statistics. Methods of primary descriptive statistics 
are numerical indicators that characterize the features of the 
distribution of the trait measured in the sample, in particular, 
reflecting the level of severity of the measured property and the 
degree of its variability. In this study, average indicators were 
used to assess the difference in the severity of psychological 
characteristics of the subjects in comparison with the norms of 
the methods. 

In the course of the study of the psychological characteristics of 
women during remission, differences in a number of indicators 

4 Results and Discussion 
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were revealed. Figure 1 shows the results of the World 
assumption scale (Padun & Kotelnikova, 2008) in women at the 
stage of diagnosis, during remission, as well as the norms of the 
methodology used. 

Figure 1 Features of world assumption of women with breast 
cancer  

 
Source: compiled by the authors 
 
According to the data obtained, women with an oncological 
diagnosis, both at the stage of its diagnosis and during remission, 
have a more pronounced belief about the benevolence of the 
surrounding world. Respondents expressed a belief about the 
security of trust in the world around them, that the people around 
them are generally kind and trustworthy. The "Self-image" 
belief, implying the subject's confidence that he is worthy of 
love and respect, and the belief about his own luck are more 
pronounced in women with breast cancer relative to the norms of 
the questionnaire.  

The conviction of women with breast cancer in remission in the 
benevolence of the world and that they were lucky, on the one 
hand, helped them to cope productively with the situation, on the 
other hand, is associated with a favorable course of the disease. 
The onset of remission for patients with an oncological 
diagnosis, as a rule, is the desired outcome of the disease, and 
enables to be sure of good luck and that the world is favorable. 
The expression of beliefs about the benevolence of the world, the 
value and significance of one's self, and luck in women at the 
stage of diagnosis can serve as a predictor for the further onset of 
remission. 

Next, we analyzed the ways of behavior in difficult life 
situations in the studied groups using the questionnaire of 
R. Lazarus (Kryukova, 2010) (Figure 2). 

Figure 2 Features of coping questionaire of women with breast 
cancer 

 
Source: compiled by the authors 
 
According to the data obtained, women in remission and at the 
stage of cancer diagnosis use the "Distancing" coping strategy 
more often compared to the norms of the questionnaire. This 
method of coping involves the application of cognitive efforts in 
order to reduce the significance of a stressful situation. 
Distancing allows to separate oneself from the situation, distract 
oneself from it, switching the attention to other aspects of life. 
To a lesser extent, relative to the norms of the methodology, the 
strategy of "Problem solving planning" is expressed in women 
who participated in the study. An analytical approach to solving 

the problem, efforts to change the situation are less often used by 
women in the situation of cancer. 

The results of the study of the level of subjective control (Bazhin 
et al., 1984) in women in remission and at the stage of diagnosis 
are presented in Figure 3. 

Figure 3 Features of the locus of control of women with breast 
cancer 

 
Source: compiled by the authors 
 
Analyzing the data obtained, we can note that women in 
remission and at the stage of diagnosis are characterized by 
externality in the field of failures, that is, they consider them the 
result of bad luck and attribute responsibility for the failures to 
other people. Also, the respondents are characterized by 
externality in family relationships: women single out their 
partners as the reason for the events taking place in the family, 
not themselves. Regarding health and illness, women with an 
oncological diagnosis are also more characterized by externality 
compared to the norms of the questionnaire. The subjects believe 
that the state of health is the result of chance, luck, a 
combination of external circumstances, and believe that recovery 
depends more on the actions of other people and doctors. In the 
field of industrial relations, women with breast cancer are 
characterized by internality, they recognize that their actions and 
efforts are an important factor in career growth, organization of 
their own activities, and relationships in a team. 

The results of comparing the indicators of Hardiness survey 
(Leontiev & Rasskazova, 2006) of respondents in remission and 
at the stage of diagnosis are shown in Figure 4. 

Figure 4 Features of resilience of women with breast cancer 

 
Source: compiled by the authors 
 
According to the data obtained, the level of resilience and its 
indicators in subjects with an oncological diagnosis is within the 
normal range. There are small differences in the indicators of 
involvement and the overall level of resilience. Involvement 
implies that a person enjoys his own activities, is involved in 
what is happening and feels confident. The opposite of 
involvement is the feeling of rejection. Resilience is a system of 
a person's beliefs about himself, about the world and 
relationships with him. The high severity of resilience and its 
components contributes to productive coping with stressful life 
situations and reducing internal tension. 
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Next, we analyzed the features of life orientation (Tsiring & 
Evnina, 2013) of women with breast cancer in remission and at 
diagnosis (Figure 5). 

Figure 5 Features of the life orientation of women with breast 
cancer 

 
Source: compiled by the authors 
 
Diagnostics of life orientation allows us to identify the 
orientation of the subject towards optimism, positive 
expectations from the future or towards pessimism, that is, 
negative expectations from the future. Comparing the data 
obtained with the characteristics of the questionnaire, we can 
note that women with breast cancer were diagnosed with 
intermediate values in the severity of optimism-pessimism, 
regardless of the features of the course of the disease (remission 
or the stage of diagnosis). 

To date, cancer remains one of the most prognostically 
unfavorable diseases worldwide, despite the constant search for 
scientific methods of treating this pathology. Such conclusions 
are based on a statistical assessment of cancer survival and the 
probability of life preservation over the past 10 years. Such a 
situation shows the need for a comprehensive, interdisciplinary 
study of this problem and consideration of other possible causes 
of this pathology, including consideration of psychological 
factors on the course of the disease and its outcome (survival).  

This study is devoted to the study of psychological 
characteristics in women diagnosed with breast cancer. Women 
in remission and women diagnosed with breast cancer who do 
not currently have information about the further course of the 
disease were selected as the study groups. These groups were 
selected in order to determine the psychological factors 
contributing to improving the long-term effectiveness of 
treatment. The results obtained in this study allow us to put 
forward two assumptions that require additional empirical 
verification. Firstly, the revealed psychological features in 
women with breast cancer can act as predictors of cancer 
pathology. Secondly, the detected psychological features can act 
as a criterion for predicting the course of the disease (the onset 
of remission). To date, work is underway to verify the 
assumptions made by continuing cooperation with women who 
participated in this study at the stage of diagnosis. At the 
moment, we are studying the features of the course of their 
disease, as well as the relationship with psychological 
characteristics during a longitudinal study designed for three 
years.  

5 Conclusion 

Currently, there are only a small number of studies that reveal 
the specific psychological characteristics of patients with breast 
cancer. The conducted research makes it possible to identify the 
specifics of the severity of psychological characteristics of 
women with cancer diagnosis and outline the prospects for 
further research. Thus, women with breast cancer, regardless of 
the course of the disease (remission or the stage of diagnosis), 
expressed beliefs about the benevolence of the world, the value 
and significance of their own Self and luck. In women with 
cancer, the coping strategy of "Distancing" prevails, and to a 
lesser extent "Problem solving planning" is expressed. Women 
in remission and at the stage of diagnosis are characterized by 

externality in the field of failures, in family relationships. 
Regarding health and illness, women with an oncological 
diagnosis are also more characterized by externality compared to 
the norms of the questionnaire. The resilience indicators of 
respondents with breast cancer are within the normal range. 
Optimism-pessimism in women with an oncological diagnosis, 
regardless of the features of the course of the disease (remission 
or the stage of diagnosis), are expressed at an average level. 

The data obtained can serve as a scientific basis for the 
development of a system of psychological support for patients 
with malignant neoplasms. Taking into account the impact of 
psychological factors on the course of the disease, the lack of 
psychological support services in oncological medical 
institutions indicates the need for scientific research aimed at 
studying the psychological determinants of the course of the 
disease, their impact on the nature of the response to antitumor 
treatment. 

Literature: 
 
1. 

2. 

Aralova, M. P., Ershova, M. P.: Personality Types of Boys and 
Girls with Oncopathology of Their Healthy Peers. North 
Caucasian Psychological Journal, 3, 2005. 160-168 pp. 

3. 

Bazhin, E. V., Golynkina, S. A., Etkind, A. M.: Method of 
Investigation of the Level of Subjective Control. Psychological 
Journal, 5(3), 1984. 152-162 pp. 

4. 

Chen, C., Ma, X., Zhong, M., Yu, Z.: Extremely Low-
frequency Electro-magnetic Fields Exposure and Female Breast 
Cancer Risk: a Meta-analysis Based on 24,338 Cases and 
60,628 Controls. Breast Cancer Research and Treatment, 123(2), 
2010. 569-576. PMID: 20145992. 

5. 

Chen, L., Malone, K. E., Li, C. I.: Bra Wearing not Associated 
with Breast Cancer Risk: a Population-based Case-control 
Study. Cancer Epidemiology, Biomarkers & Prevention, 23(10), 
2014. 2181-2185 pp. PMCID: PMC4184992. 

6. 

Chida, Y., Hamer, M., Wardle, J., Steptoe, A.: Do Stress-
related Psychosocial Factors Contribute to Cancer Incidence 
and Survival? Nature Clinical Practice Oncology, 5-8, 2008. 
466-475 pp. 

7. 

Chissov, V. I., Starinsky, V. V., Petrova, G. V.: Malignant 
Neoplasms in Russia in 2010 (Morbidity and Mortality). 
Moscow: Federal State University "P. A. Herzen Institute of 
Medical Research" of the Ministry of Health of the Russian 
Federation, 2012. 260 p. 

8. 

Chulkova, V. A., Pestereva, E. V.: Socio-psychological 
Aspects of Oncological Diseases in Modern Society. Social 
Psychology and Society, 6(1), 2015. 117-126 pp. 

9. 

Colditz, G. A.: Relationship between Estrogen Levels, Use of 
Hormone Replacement Therapy, and Breast Cancer. Journal of 
the National Cancer Institute, 90(11), 1998. 814-823 pp. 

10. 

Collaborative Group on Hormonal Factors in Breast Cancer. 
Breast Cancer and Breastfeeding: Collaborative Reanalysis of 
Individual Data from Epidemiological Studies in 30 Countries, 
Including 50302 Women with Breast Cancer and 96973 Women 
without the Disease. The Lancet, 360(9328), 2002. 187-195 pp. 
PMID: 12133652. 

11. 

Collaborative Group on Hormonal Factors in Breast 
Cancer. Breast Cancer and Hormonal Contraceptives: 
Collaborative Reanalysis of Individual Data on 53 297 Women 
with Breast Cancer and 100 239 Women without Breast Cancer 
from 54 Epidemiological Studies. The Lancet, 347(9017), 1996. 
1713-1727 pp. PMID: 8656904. 

12. 

Collaborative Group on Hormonal Factors in Breast 
Cancer. Menarche, Menopause, and Breast Cancer Risk: 
Individual Participant Meta-analysis, Including 118 964 Women 
with Breast Cancer from 117 Epidemiological Studies. The 
Lancet, 13(11), 2012. 1141-1151 pp. PMCID: PMC3488186. 

Egorova, A. G., Shaplygin, L. V.: Epidemiological 
Significance of Various Forms of Malignant Neoplasms. 
Oncological Dispensary. P. A. Herzen Journal, 2(4), 2013. 57-62 
pp. 

- 196 -



A D  A L T A   J O U R N A L  O F  I N T E R D I S C I P L I N A R Y  R E S E A R C H  
 

 

13. 

14. 

Eysenck, H.: Cancer, Personality and Stress: Prediction 
and Prevention. Advances in Behaviour Research and Therapy, 
16, 1994. 167-215 pp. 

15. 

Familial Breast Cancer Working Group. Familial Breast 
Cancer: Collaborative Reanalysis of Individual Data from 52 
Epidemiological Studies Including 58,209 Women with Breast 
Cancer and 101,986 Women without the Disease. The Lancet, 
358(9291), 2001. 1389-1399 pp. PMID: 11705483. 

Fasano, J., Shao, T., Huang, H., Kessler, A. J., Kolodka, O. 
P., Shapiro, C. L.: Optimism and Coping: Do They Influence 
Health Outcomes in Women with Breast Cancer? A Systemic 
Review and Meta-analysis. Breast Cancer Research and 
Treatment, 183, 2020. 495-501 pp. doi

16. 

: 10.1007/s10549-020-
05800-5 

17. 

Ferlay, J., Ervik, M., Lam, F., Colombet, M., Mery, L., 
Piñeros, M., Znaor, A., Soerjomataram, I., Bray, F.: Global 
Cancer Observatory: Cancer Today. Lyon, France: International 
Agency for Research on Cancer, 2020. Available from 
https://gco.iarc.fr/today 

18. 

He, C., Anand, S. T., Ebell, M. H., Vena, J. E., Robb, S. W.: 
Circadian Disrupting Exposures and Breast Cancer Risk: a 
Meta-analysis. International Archives of Occupational and 
Environmental Health, 88(5), 2015. 533-547 pp. PMID: 
25261318. 

19. Key, T., Appleby, P., Barnes, I., Reeves, G.: Endogenous 
Sex Hormones and Breast Cancer in Postmenopausal Women: 
Reanalysis of Nine Prospective Studies. Journal of the National 
Cancer Institute, 94(8), 2002. 606-616 pp. PMID: 11959894. 

Ivashkina, M. G.: Psychocorrection and Psychocorrection 
Support of Personality in the Conditions of Oncological Disease. 
In Actual Problems of Diagnosis and Development of 
Personality in Norm and Pathology: Collective monograph. 
Saint-Louis: Publishing House Science and Innovation Center, 
2016. 193-202 pp. 

20. Key, T. J., Appleby, P. N., Reeves, G. K., …, Vineis, P.: Sex 
Hormones and Risk of Breast Cancer in Premenopausal Women: 
a Collaborative Reanalysis of Individual Participant Data from 
Seven Prospective Studies. The Lancet, 14(10), 2013. 1009-
1019. PMID: 23890780. 
21. 

22. 

Kryukova, T. L.: Methods of Studying Coping Behavior: 
Three Coping Scales. 2nd ed., corrected, supplemented. 
Kostroma: Nekrasov State University, 2010. 62 p. 

23. 

Leontiev, D. A., Rasskazova, E. I.: A Resilience Test. 
Moscow: Sense, 2006. 63 p. 

Letyagin, V. P., 

24. 

Vysotskaya, I. V., Kim, E. A.: Risk Factors 
for Breast Cancer. Mammalogy, 4, 2006. 10-12 pp.  

25. 

Lipworth, L., Tarone, R. E., Friis, S., …, McLaughlin, K.: 
Cancer among Scandinavian Women with Cosmetic Breast 
Implants: a Pooled Long-term Follow-up Study. International 
Journal of Cancer, 124(2), 2009. 490-493 pp. PMID: 19003966. 

26. 

Malkina-Pyh, I. G.: Psychosomatics. Moscow: Eksmo, 
2008. 992 p. 

27. 

Merabishvili, V. M.: Malignant Tumors in the World. 
Russia, Saint-Petersburg. St. Petersburg: COSTA, 2007. 422 p.  

28. 

Mikoczy, Z., Tinnerberg, H., Bjork, J., Albin, M.: Cancer 
Incidence and Mortality in Swedish Sterilant Workers Exposed 
to Ethylene Oxide: Updated Cohort Study Findings 1972–2006. 
International Journal of Environmental Research and Public 
Health, 8(6), 2011. 2009-2019 pp. PMCID: PMC3138010. 

29. 

Mirick, D. K., Davis, S., Thomas, D. B.: Antiperspirant Use 
and the Risk of Breast Cancer. Journal of the National Cancer 
Institute, 94(20), 2002. 1578-1580 pp. PMID: 12381712. 

30. Renehan, A. G., Tyson, M., Egger, M., Heller, R. F., 
Zwahlen, M.: Body-mass Index and Incidence of Cancer: a 
Systematic Review and Meta-analysis of Prospective 
Observational Studies. Lancet, 371(9612), 2008. 569-578 pp. 
PMID: 18280327. 

Padun, M. A., Kotelnikova, A. V.: Modification of the 
Methodology for the Study of Basic Beliefs of Individuals R. 
Yanoff-Bulman. Psychological Journal, 29(4), 2008. 98-106 pp. 

31. 

32. Shen, D., Mao. W., Liu, T., Lin, Q., Lu, X., Wang, Q., Lin, 
F., Ekelund, U., Wijndaele, K.: Sedentary Behavior and Incident 
Cancer: a Meta-analysis of Prospective Studies. PLOS ONE, 
9(8), 2014. e105709. PMCID: PMC4143275. 

Revidi, P.: Psychopathologie des Cancer. Sem Hop Paris, 
59(12), 1983. 809-810 pp.  

33. 

34. 

Sukhareva, E. A., Egorova, A. G., Somov, A. N.: 
Characteristics of Oncoepidemiological Risk Factors for Breast 
Diseases. Medical Almanac, 6(51), 2017. 94-98 pp. 

35. Suzuki, R., Orsini, N., Saji, S., Key, T. J., Wolk, A.: Body 
Weight and Incidence of Breast Cancer Defined by Estrogen and 
Progesterone Receptor Status: a Meta-analysis. International 
Journal of Cancer, 124(3), 2009. 698-712 pp. PMID: 18988226. 

Sung, H., Ferlay, J., Siegel, R. L., Laversanne, M., 
Soerjomataram, I., Jemal, A., Bray, F.: Global Cancer Statistics 
2020: GLOBOCAN Estimates of Incidence and Mortality 
Worldwide for 36 Cancers in 185 Countries. A Cancer Journal 
for Clinicians. 2021 Feb 4. doi: 10.3322/caac.21660 

36. 

37. 

Takkouche, B., Etminan, M., Montes-Martinez, A.: 
Personal Use of Hair Dyes and Risk of Cancer: a Meta-analysis. 
Journal of the American Medical Association, 293(20), 2005. 
2516-2525 pp. PMID: 15914752. 

38. 

Tarabrina, N. V.: Post-Traumatic Stress in Patients with 
Life Threatening (Cancer) Diseases. Journal of Counseling 
Psychology and Psychotherapy, 1, 2014. 36-90 pp. 

39. 

Temoshok, L.: Personality, Coping Style, Emotion and 
Cancer: Towards an Integrative Model. Cancer Surveys, 6, 
1987. 545-567 pp. 

40. 

Thomas, H. V., Reeves, G. K., Key, T. J.: Endogenous 
Estrogen and Postmenopausal Breast Cancer: a Quantitative 
Review. Cancer Causes & Control, 8(6), 1997. 922-928 pp.  

41. Vrieling, A., Buck, K., Kaaks, R., Chang-Chang-Claude, J.: 
Adult Weight Gain in Relation to Breast Cancer Risk by 
Estrogen and Progesterone Receptor Status: a Meta-analysis. 
Breast Cancer Research and Treatment, 123(3), 2010. 641-649 
pp. PMID: 20711809. 

Tsiring, D. A., Evnina, K. Yu.: Issues of Diagnostics of 
Optimism and Pessimism in the Context of the Theory of 
Dispositional Optimism. Psychological Research, 6(31), 2013. 
6 p. 

42. 

43. 

Wiebe, J. P., Beausoleil, M., Zhang, G., Cialacu, V.: 
Opposing Actions of the Progesterone Metabolites, 5alpha-
dihydroprogesterone (5alphaP) and 3alpha-
dihydroprogesterone (3alphaHP) on Mitosis, Apoptosis, and 
Expression of Bcl-2, Bax and p21 in Human Breast Cell Lines. 
The Journal of Steroid Biochemistry and Molecular Biology, 
118(1–2), 2010. 125-132 pp. PMID: 19931389. 

44. Yager, J. D., Davidson, N. E.: Estrogen Carcinogenesis in 
Breast Cancer. The New England Journal of Medicine, 354(3), 
2006. 270-282 pp. PMID: 16421368. 

Wiebe, J. P.: Progesterone Metabolites in Breast Cancer. 
Endocrine-Related Cancer, 13(3), 2006. 717-738 pp. PMID: 
16954427. 

45. 

46. Zhang, X., Tworoger, S. S., Eliassen, A. H., Hankinson, S. 
E.: Postmenopausal Plasma Sex Hormone Levels and Breast 
Cancer Risk Over 20 Years of Follow-up. Breast Cancer 
Research and Treatment, 137(3), 2013. 883-892 pp. PMCID: 
PMC3582409. 

Zanetta, G. M., Webb, M. J., Li, H., Keeney, G. L.: 
Hyperestrogenism: A Relevant Risk Factor for the Development 
of Cancer from Endometriosis. Gynecologic Oncology, 79(1), 
2000 Oct. 18-22 pp. 

47. Zhou, Y., Zhao, H., Peng, C.: Association of Sedentary 
Behavior with the Risk of Breast Cancer in Women: Update 
Meta-analysis of Observational Studies. Annals of 
Epidemiology, 25(9), 2015. 687-697 pp. PMID: 26099193. 
 
Primary Paper Section: A, F 
 
Secondary Paper Section: AN, FD 

- 197 -




