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Abstract: In a constantly changing world, the ability to manage crises effectively 
determines the stability and resilience of organisations in the long term. It is especially 
significant in the context of global interconnectivity and rapid technological 
development, where crises can immediately impact various aspects of life. The 
research conducted focuses on three key aspects of crisis management. The first 
section examines the significance of combining strategic planning with the latest 
innovations, enabling organisations to anticipate and respond to potential crises 
flexibly and efficiently. The second section analyses gender diversity in leadership and 
its impact on crisis management. Gender-diverse leadership teams can offer a broader 
range of approaches and solutions, enabling a more balanced and comprehensive crisis 
resolution strategy. In the third section, we explore the role of social media as a tool 
for effective crisis management, highlighting its ability to provide rapid data collection 
and analysis, which is essential for timely responses to crises. The research findings 
reveal innovative strategies and approaches in crisis management that merge strategic 
planning with gender diversity and the latest communication technologies. 
 
Keywords: innovative strategies, communication technologies, emergencies, public 
administration, civil security. 
 

 
1 Introduction 

Crisis management becomes particularly relevant in a world 
constantly reshaped by economic shocks and political crises. 
Learning from the past and using that knowledge to enhance 
future strategies is vital for the survival and prosperity of modern 
organisations. Our article aims to deepen theoretical and 
practical knowledge in this critical area by underlining the 
importance of this task. Emergencies, ranging from natural 
disasters to technological accidents and epidemics, require 
prompt and effective public management decisions to ensure 
civil safety. Therefore, it is essential to develop flexible 
strategies that can be quickly adapted to changing conditions 
while still ensuring the protection and safety of citizens. In this 
context, practical crisis management approaches, strategic 
planning, and the inclusion of gender diversity in leadership are 
crucial for creating a public management system ready to meet 
contemporary emergencies’ challenges. 

The research results are divided into three sections, each 
highlighting specific aspects of crisis management. The first 
section concentrates on strategic planning and innovation, 
demonstrating how advanced technologies and creative 
approaches can enhance an organisation’s capacity to anticipate 
and respond to crises. The second section examines the influence 
of gender diversity and leadership qualities on effective crisis 
management, evaluating how diverse perspectives can enrich 
decision-making processes. The final section concludes the 
review by discussing the role of social media in crisis 
management. It explores the potential of social media as a tool 
for rapid data gathering and communication with key 
stakeholders. Synthesis of these three key areas provides deeper 
insight into building robust crisis strategies that are effective for 
the present and future, leading to new heights of flexibility and 
progress. 

This article aims to present an overview of current approaches 
and methodologies in crisis management, particularly 
emphasising the significance of crisis forecasting and the 
creation of predictive models. We seek to investigate the 
relationship between strategic planning, leadership, and 
innovation in addressing crisis challenges and analyse the effect 

of gender diversity on decision-making processes in crises. In 
this study, we examine the function of social media in crisis 
management, specifically as a means of data collection and 
effective communication. 

2 Literature review 

In today’s fast-paced world, managing crises is a significant 
challenge for organisations of all sizes and types. The study by 
Adamski and Gallagher (2022) emphasises the significance of an 
integrated approach to crisis management in critical care 
settings. It highlights the need for adaptation and rapid response 
to changing circumstances. Ahmed et al. (2023) further analyse 
the impact of integrated artificial intelligence on crisis 
management and lean production. Using a structural equation 
model, their research underlines how technological innovations 
can contribute to more efficient crisis management. Arrieta and 
Davies (2024) continue their research on local self-governance 
in England and the constraints of resilience in crisis 
management. They reveal that despite efforts, structural and 
resource constraints can hinder the effective resolution of crises. 

The study by Asinthara et al. (2023) focuses on the practical 
application of digital social media analysis for crisis 
management. It demonstrates the potential of machine learning 
models to categorise tweets during disasters and identify and 
respond to emergencies in real time. Bahorka et al. (2022) 
examine the role of marketing activities in crisis management, 
highlighting the significance of establishing and retaining 
consumer trust during and after crisis periods. The authors’ 
analysis enhances comprehension of how effective 
communication and marketing strategies can contribute to crisis 
management. 

The research conducted by Bothe et al. (2023) analyses the role 
of the OSCE in supporting peace and security, with a focus on 
conflict prevention, crisis management, and peaceful dispute 
resolution. The study expands the discussion, highlighting the 
global aspect of crisis management and the significance of 
international collaboration for successful conflict resolution. 
Continuing the analytical literature review on crisis 
management, it is essential to note the study by Brecher and 
Wilkenfeld (2022). The authors provide a comprehensive 
overview of crisis theories and their management, analysing 
various dimensions of crises, from political to social, and 
offering a comprehensive view of mechanisms for effective 
response. This general understanding of crisis management is 
complemented by the study by Buhagiar and Anand (2023), 
which focuses on the synergy between leadership, knowledge 
management, and organisational learning as critical elements in 
crisis management. This triad contributes to the development of 
flexible strategies and increases the efficiency of crisis 
management. 

Curnin et al. (2023) investigate the perception of strategic 
decision-making by crisis teams during training and identify key 
dimensions for assessing the effectiveness of crisis management. 
The research highlights the importance of practical training and 
strategy rehearsal in improving crisis preparedness. El-latief et 
al. (2023) analysed the impact of strategic intelligence on crisis 
management effectiveness in four and five-star hotels in Luxor 
and Aswan. The study found that a high level of strategic 
intelligence can significantly improve the ability to respond 
effectively to crisis events. Gernego et al. (2022) examine crisis 
management in the energy sector in the face of increasing 
epidemiological risks. The authors emphasise adapting crisis 
management strategies to the sector’s specificities to ensure 
resilience. Haase (2023) discusses the uncertainty in crisis 
management, highlighting the importance of flexible and 
adaptable strategies for effective responses to unforeseen events. 
Jin’s (2023) research proposes a Crisis Communication Think 
Tank (CCTT) approach to crisis management. The study 
highlights the importance of integrating communication 
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strategies with overall response plans and emphasises the 
significance of communication and interaction as a foundation 
for successful crisis management. 

The following study, which is part of an analytical review of 
literature on crisis management, is by Pohrishchuk et al. (2023). 
The study focuses on modelling the application of crisis 
management in the economy’s engineering sector. It highlights 
the importance of a strategic approach to crisis management in 
this field and the need for innovative solutions to overcome 
economic challenges. 

Raut et al. (2022) conducted a study examining the impact of 
workforce flexibility on crisis management, focusing on job 
characteristics and support from higher administrative authorities 
in public management. The authors identify flexibility as a 
crucial factor enabling effective crisis response and promoting 
organisational resilience. Salnikova et al. (2019) propose a 
matrix approach to risk management in the national security 
system. The approach distinguishes criteria for selecting an 
optimal decision-making strategy, allowing for the systematic 
and efficient management of risks. It is crucial for ensuring 
national security. The study conducted by Sharma et al. (2022) 
analyses the evolving role of innovation in crisis management 
during the COVID-19 pandemic through an integrative literature 
review. The authors highlight the significance of innovation in 
addressing crises, providing novel prospects for improving crisis 
management effectiveness. Sharma et al. (2022) investigate the 
potential of big data analytics in crisis management from the 
perspective of information processing theory. The authors 
contend that big data can enhance an organisation’s ability to 
respond to crises. Shpak and colleagues (2022a; 2022b) analyse 
the interconnection between macroeconomic indicators and CO2 
emissions in the EU. They propose management strategies for 
reducing ecological impact. These studies are crucial for 
understanding the economic aspects of crisis management in the 
context of environmental sustainability. Shulga and Busser 
(2024) examine the management of the COVID-19 crisis in 
terms of human resource costs, emphasising the significance of 
transformational leadership and ethical climate. The study 
highlights the crucial role of leadership and organisational 
culture in effective crisis management. 

Karlsen and Antonsen’s research (2023) stands out in crisis 
management during pandemics. They offer a literature review of 
crisis management from 1984 to 2019, analysing how the 
perception of crisis management has changed. The authors 
emphasise pandemic preparedness and response, highlighting the 
importance of strategic thinking and adaptability. Ketter (2022) 
investigates crisis management strategies in tourist destinations, 
exploring their resilience and recovery after a crisis. The study 
highlights the distinction between recovering to a ‘previous 
state’ and achieving ‘a better state,’ which is crucial for 
comprehending the long-term effects of crisis events on tourist 
regions. Ledi et al. (2024) investigate the impact of gender 
diversity and strategic thinking on crisis management. Their 
findings suggest that integrating these factors into crisis 
strategies significantly improves efficiency. It is essential to note 
the need for straightforward integration of gender diversity and 
strategic thinking in crisis management. Li et al. (2023) propose 
an optimisation model for crisis management and public safety 
in cities through the integration of artificial intelligence 
technologies. The research highlights the potential of AI in 
improving responses to crises and managing public safety. 

Maghdid et al. (2022) analyse the causes and consequences of 
crises in the public sector, emphasising the importance of 
transitioning from crises to effective crisis management. The 
authors suggest a deep understanding of crisis phenomena is 
necessary to develop resilient management strategies. The study 
by Oh et al. (2022) examines crisis management to ensure 
sustainable corporate value. The authors reveal the interplay 
between social distancing, crisis response, and its severity and 
determine that finding a balance among these factors is critical to 
effective crisis management. Oscarsson (2022) views crisis 
management as a dynamic process intertwined with everyday 

work activities, emphasising the importance of adapting to 
changing conditions. This research shows that successful crisis 
management requires flexibility and integration with regular 
work processes. Park et al. (2022) emphasise the significance of 
internal resources in enhancing local government resilience, 
highlighting their importance in crisis management. The authors 
suggest that strengthening internal resources is crucial to 
effective crisis response. 

In her study, Syrovatka (2024) examines the end of the strict 
austerity era and national competitiveness councils’ failures. The 
author argues for the need to rethink European crisis 
management approaches and adapt strategies to the changing 
global economic circumstances. Tanashchuk et al. (2018) present 
theoretical and methodological principles for managing the 
capital structure in telecommunications operators’ innovative 
activities. Their work emphasises the importance of innovation 
as a critical element in strategic crisis management, especially in 
technology-oriented sectors. Uy et al. (2023) demonstrate the 
application of the theory of adaptive crisis management, 
focusing on the dynamics of leadership in times of crisis. They 
find that flexible leadership can significantly improve an 
organisation’s ability to respond effectively to unforeseen 
challenges. 

Wolbers (2022) explores distributed sensemaking in crisis 
management, using the Utrecht terrorist attack as a case study. 
This account emphasises the significance of coordination and 
collaboration among organisations for effective crisis resolution. 
Xue et al. (2022) introduce the fundamental concepts of crisis 
and crisis management and discuss the challenges of 
transitioning to crisis management in China. This study reveals 
the global context of crisis management, indicating the 
universality and specificity of crisis strategies in different 
cultural and political conditions. Zhou et al. (2022) investigated 
the effectiveness of social media in crisis management, 
specifically focusing on the efficacy of non-pharmacological 
interventions for managing COVID-19 challenges. The study 
highlights the significance of digital platforms as tools for 
information dissemination and community support during crises. 
Each of these studies contributes to a multifaceted understanding 
of crisis management. They cover various topics, from 
developing innovative strategies to adapting leadership and 
using digital technologies. The studies emphasise the importance 
of flexibility, strategic thinking, and cross-sector collaboration 
for effective crisis response. However, exploring crisis 
management by learning from past experiences and improving 
strategies remains relatively uncharted territory. It affirms the 
relevance of our chosen topic.  

3 Methods 
 
To achieve this goal, we use a holistic approach that integrates 
systemic and structural-functional analysis to study the 
individual elements of crisis management and their interplay 
within the organisational structure. We apply the methods of 
analysis and synthesis to examine the components of strategic 
planning and leadership behaviour, their role, and their impact 
on the overall effectiveness of crisis management. The 
quantitative method is performed to process and analyse 
statistical data. It will enable us to assess the impact of various 
factors on crisis management outcomes and ensure the 
objectivity of our conclusions. 

The results of the analysis will form the basis for 
recommendations to improve strategic management of crises. 
These recommendations will be helpful for leaders and managers 
of organisations across different sectors.  
 
4 Results 
 
I. In an often unstable world, strategic planning and innovation 
are crucial for crisis management. Strategic planning aims to 
predict potential crises and enable an organisation to adapt 
quickly, finding creative solutions to complex situations. 
Innovations, in particular offer new possibilities for responding 
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to current challenges and strengthening organisational resilience 
to future shocks. 

The economic aspect of crisis management will be examined 
regarding market dynamics, as shown in Figure 1. 

 

Figure 1. Global Crisis Management Market by Region 
Source: Global Market Insights (n. d.) 

 
The graph presents data indicating global crisis management 
market changes from 2018 to 2022. Although the market has 
shown signs of instability, it also presents potential growth 
opportunities. The pandemic led to a surge in demand for 
management services, particularly in North America and Europe, 
highlighting the growing recognition of the need for crisis 
preparedness. 

Innovations often involve introducing technologies that can 
improve data collection, analytics, and operational problem-
solving in this field. It applies to information systems and 
organisational behaviour and leadership, requiring intellectual 
flexibility to adapt to changing circumstances. Therefore, 
strategic planning and innovation in crisis management go 
beyond simply responding to adversity. They are essential to 
actively shaping the future, where knowledge, technology, and 
readiness for change are fundamental for survival and 
development in an unpredictable world. 

ІІ. In contemporary crisis management, gender diversity and 
leadership are increasingly important. Gender diversity goes 
beyond just balancing the number of men and women in 
decision-making; it broadens perspectives, enabling 
organisations to incorporate a broader range of views and 
approaches, particularly in response to crises. 

When examining leadership from a gender perspective, it is 
essential to note that diverse leadership styles can offer various 
strategies for crisis resolution. Women and men often exhibit 
different approaches to leadership, which can provide additional 
benefits in crisis management. For example, female leadership is 
often characterised by empathy and a cooperative style, while 
male leadership may be more assertive and risk-taking. Both 
approaches are essential and effective, especially when 
combined to create a balanced leadership strategy. 

Studies have found that organisations with higher levels of 
gender diversity in leadership often perform better, particularly 
in the context of crisis management. Gender diversity fosters 
high creativity and a more significant number of ideas and 
strategies, which can lead to more innovative solutions in 
response to unpredictable challenges. Leadership in crisis 
management goes beyond traditional power and control, offering 
a flexible and inclusive model that includes a broader range of 
voices and experiences. In this context, crisis management 
requires a coordinated collective effort that embraces the full 
spectrum of gender perspectives, resulting in more resilient and 
enduring leadership. 

ІІІ. Social media platforms have become integral to daily life, 
and their importance in management processes is increasingly 
recognised. They provide unique real-time situation monitoring 
and data collection opportunities that can inform decision-
making and develop adequate crisis responses. In times of crisis, 
the speed and accuracy of response can often affect human lives 
and organisational stability. Social media enables early detection 

of crisis trends, crucial for preventing or minimising harm. Data 
analytics from social networks help leaders understand public 
perceptions of organisational messages and quickly adapt 
communication strategies to changing conditions. 

Additionally, social media serves as a two-way communication 
channel, engaging organisations, their clients, and stakeholders 
in dialogue. It promotes trust and transparency in crisis 
management, ensuring all interested parties have a voice. During 
a crisis, organisations can use social media to disseminate 
important messages, guidance, and support, positioning 
themselves as a reliable source of information. 

Furthermore, analysing and monitoring social media reactions to 
crisis events can serve as a crucial indicator for evaluating the 
effectiveness of crisis responses. Collecting data on feedback, 
dissemination, and emotional reception of crisis communications 
can provide valuable insights that can be used to refine future 
strategies. Therefore, social media is not just a tool for 
communication during crises but also an integral component of 
crisis management, combining technological innovations, 
strategic vision, and the human dimension into a single practical 
system. 

5 Discussion 
 
The chosen subject matter includes questions that are continually 
discussed in the literature. We will focus on three critical debate 
points and express our vision for their development and 
resolution. 

The first point we will emphasise is the substance and 
significance of strategic planning in crises. One perspective, as 
highlighted by the research of Curnin and colleagues (Curnin et 
al., 2023), emphasises the importance of flexibility and 
adaptability in strategies. It suggests that rigid adherence to 
predefined plans can lead to adverse outcomes in the dynamic 
conditions of a crisis. As advocated by Uy and others (Uy et al., 
2023), the opposing viewpoint argues that well-structured 
strategic planning can provide clarity and guidance during a 
crisis, enabling organisations to recover more quickly. Our 
evaluation is that genuine strategic planning should harmonise 
flexibility with structure, allowing for adaptation to crisis 
conditions while having a clear roadmap for action. 

The second focal point pertains to the impact of gender diversity 
on leadership during crises. There are debates between those 
who believe that gender diversity is crucial for innovation and a 
comprehensive understanding of crises (Wolbers, 2022) and 
those who emphasise the importance of expertise and 
competencies, regardless of gender. Gender diversity can enrich 
perspectives and encourage the creation of more flexible and 
inclusive leadership approaches. 

Finally, discussions often centre on using social media in crisis 
management, raising questions about the effectiveness and 
reliability of the information provided by these platforms. Some 
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researchers argue that social media can exacerbate panic and 
disinformation (Uy et al., 2023), while others view them as a 
powerful tool for rapid information dissemination and data 
collection (Curnin et al., 2023). When used responsibly, social 
media can significantly improve the effectiveness of crisis 
management by providing a direct connection between the 
organisation and its audience. 
 
6 Conclusion 
 
Our research indicates that the resilience of organisations during 
crises is determined by the depth of strategic planning and the 
refinement of innovative approaches. It is crucial to strike a 
balance between flexibility, which allows for swift adaptation to 
unforeseen circumstances, and structured processes that provide 
stability and predictability in management. The novelty of this 
approach lies in establishing that effective crisis management 
requires a harmonious symbiosis of these two concepts, where 
strategic plans must be flexible enough to allow rapid course 
adjustments depending on situational developments yet maintain 
a clear set of goals and values that guide the organisation 
throughout the crisis. 

Additionally, exploring gender diversity in leadership roles 
opens new opportunities for crisis management. Our analysis has 
confirmed that gender diversity at the management level can 
enhance innovation and creative problem-solving. Integrating 
this diversity into managerial structures can increase the breadth 
of perspectives and approaches utilised during crises and foster 
the development of more effective communication strategies that 
meet the needs of diverse stakeholder groups. This approach 
involves integrating diverse gender perspectives into decision-
making to promote inclusivity and consider a broader range of 
experiences and knowledge. It enhances the overall adaptability 
and efficiency of crisis management. 

The results underscore the importance of balancing flexible and 
structured approaches in strategic planning. Additionally, the 
contributions of women’s leadership and the value of social 
media as a bidirectional tool for communication and data 
gathering are recognised. This work offers updated approaches 
to crisis management while acknowledging limitations arising 
from the variability of external conditions and the rapid 
evolution of technology. 

Further exploration of the impact of cultural factors on the 
choice of crisis management strategies and investigation of the 
deeper psychological aspects of leadership responses to crises is 
recommended. It will enrich the theoretical foundations of crisis 
management and ensure the practical application of strategies 
across a broader range of crises. 
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